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JURY TRIAL

Civil Action No. 4:16-CV-912-ALM

Plaintiffs,

Defendant.

v.

DAVID CRUSON AND JOHN DENMAN

IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

SHERMAN DIVISION
§
§
§
§
§
§
§
§
§
§
§
§

JACKSON NATIONAL LIFE INSURANCE §
COMPANY §

§
§
§
§

DECLARATION OF GARY D. CORLEY IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS' CO-LEAD
COUNSEL'S MOTION FOR AWARD OF ATTORNEYS' FEES AND

REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
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I, Gary D. Corley, declare and state as follows :

1. I am the managing attorney of Gary D. Corley, P.C. d/b/a Corley Law Firm

hereinafter referred to as ("Corley Law Firm "). I submit this declaration in support of Plaintiffs

Counsel's application for an award of attorneys ' fees in connection with the services rendered in

this litigation. I make this Declaration based on my personal knowledge and if called as a witness,

I could and would competently testify to the matters stated herein.

2. This Declaration summarizes the experience and competencies of my firm and its

timekeepers, as well as the factual and procedural history of this litigation.

Expertise in Complex Litigation

3. I have been admitted to practice in Texas since 1985. After my clerkship under the

Honorable Paul N. Brown, United States District Judge for the Eastern District ofTexas , Sherman

Division, I became an associate for Cantey & Hanger in its Fort Worth, Texas offices. While with

Cantey & Hanger, I worked on complex commercial litigation cases in the federal courts including

a Robinson-Pattman Act case for Voluntary Purchasing Group Co-op against Mississippi

Chemical Corporation, Mississippi Federated Co-op and Arkansas Federated Co-op. I left Cantey

& Hanger in 1991 to start a solo practice in Sherman, Texas. For the past 30 years, my practice

has consisted of complex commercial litigation of varying types, as well as representation of

people of ordinary standing in our community and across the country in Louisiana, Mississippi,

Florida, New York and Arizona. I have experience in antitrust, securities, class, derivative, and

intellectual property litigation.

4. The practice of Corley Law Firm is currently, and for the past 10 years, has been

primarily focused on commercial and business litigation. The firm has served, or is currently

serving, as lead counsel in a number of business litigation lawsuits in state court, including:
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• Wash Technologies ofAmerica Corporation , et al. v. John C. Pappas ,
Case No. 18-0276, Texas Supreme Court , CGA Case No. 05-16-00633­
CV (Corley Law Firm defending the trial court 's judgment after ajury
verdict for Plaintiff on a fraud in the sale of real estate action);

• Bryan Inman vs, Patrick Henry Medical, LLC, Case No. 19-0384, Texas
Supreme Court, CGA Case No. 05-18-00130-CV (Corley Law Firm for
defendant in defending the trial court 's Summary Judgment in a breach
of contract case); and

• John C. Pappas and WashBiz, Inc. vs. Shamoun & Norman LLP, CGA
Case No. 05-16-01405 (5th District ofDallas) (Corley Law Firm lead
counsel for the defendant reversing judgment for the plaintiff on its
attorney's fees for the tria l court's lack of jurisdiction)(Petition for
Review and for Reconsideration Denied) .

• D.G. Brothers, Inc. vs. Pizza Inn, Inc., CGA Case No. 05-98-01468-CV
(Fifth District Court, Dallas, County, Texas)(Stagner & Corley for the
plaintiff in a breach of contract case)

• John Corley vs. Bergfeld Center, CGA Case No. 12-97-00189-CV
(Gary D. Corley representing defendant/appellant on a breach of lease
agreement case)

• Michael Russell v. Monte Bond, CGA No. 05-97-00678-CV (Gary D.
Corley served as lead counsel for Michael Russell)

• Douglas Distributing Company vs. Honorable Ray Grisham, 05-96­
01768-CV (Gary D. Corley defending a ruling by the Honorable Ray
Grisham in a discovery dispute) ;

• John Cain vs. Jamie Pruett, et aI., CGA No. 05-95-01439-CV (Corley
Law Firm served as lead counsel for plaintiff/appellee in defending
judgment entered on ajury verdict); and, among others

• Clyde Royce Hall vs. City ofMarlin, Texas, Case No.1 0-92-00133-CV
(Gary D. Corley prosecuting an appeal of the lower court's ruling in
favor of a directed verdict for the City of Marlin , Texas).

Corley Law Firm's Role in the Litigation

5. I have been personally involved in this litigation since April of 20 16. I initially met

with Timothy Hightower and Rory McDonald to gather evidence which formed the underp inning

of the claims which were eventually framed in the original complaint filed in this Court . I

recognized that this matter would require substant ial resources and attorney commitment and an
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attorney experienced in class action cases so I called Sam Baxter ofMcKool Smith to seek McKool

Smith 's engagement as lead co-counsel. Sam told me that his firm handles class action cases and

steered me to call upon Lew LeClair. I met with Lew along with Tim Hightower and Rory

McDonald to layout the basis for the claims. Lew presented the case to McKool 's Management

Committee which approved McKool Smith 's involvement to participate in bringing and

prosecuting the claims.

6. As co-counsel, I have been directly involved in all facets of the discovery and

motion practice, the appeal to the Fifth Circuit Court of Appeals, and the settlement negotiations.

I participated in class-wide strategy sessions, edited and revised key pleadings, defended putative

class representative depositions, participated in preparation and service of discovery on Jackson

National, participated in the review of document discovery from Jackson National, participated in

settlement negotiations, and participated in post-settlement motions and discussions.

7. Jared T. Elk joined the Corley Law Firm in March of 2018. He is a 2016 Baylor

Law graduate. His role in the case consisted of providing support to the legal strategies, preparing

motions, answering discovery and conducting legal research regarding the certification appellate

and the personal jurisdictional issues raised by Jackson National. Mr. Elk acted as liaison between

Corley Law Firm and McKool Smith in interactions with Rudy Fink of McKool Smith. Mr. Elk

played a significant role also, after a settlement had been reached , in developing distribution of

recovery models using the data Jackson National provided to Plaintiffs ' counsel.

8. Plaintiffs' Counsel have worked cooperatively throughout this litigation to assign

tasks, monitor the quality of work performed, and to avoid duplication wherever possible. Each

firm has kept detailed contemporaneous records of hours billed , Plaintiffs ' Counsel have kept each

other apprised of all billing and expense records throughout the litigation.

- 3 -
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9. Attached as Exhibit 1 to this declaration are the final billings records of the Corley

Law Firm. I have gone back over these billings to be sure that the work done by our firm inured to

the common benefit of the class , and that claimed expenses were reasonably charged to the case.

I reviewed all of my firm 's daily time and expense records and deleted any entries that were not

sufficiently supported or were otherwise inappropriately billed to the case.

10. Corley Law Firm 's billing statement reflects the hours billed at standard rates for

each timekeeper. The fees and hours associated with each timekeeper are as follows :

Timekeeper Hours Rate Dollars

Gary D. Corley

Jared T. Elk

Total

1322.9

207.6

$400.00

$250.00

$529,160 .00

$ 51,900.00

$581,060.00

11. This total number of hours and corresponding fee is, in my experience, entirely

reasonable for the role played by our firm in this matter. Our billings reflect an efficient use of

attorney resources during and throughout the litigation at reasonable hourly rates. In particular,

once the agreement was reached to join McKool Smith as lead class counsel, and Corley Law Firm

as co-counsel in September 2016, our firm worked significantly with lead class counsel.

12. Plaintiffs faced significant risks attendant to bringing a complex case to a settlement

with Defendant. Jurisdictional questions along with the affirmative defenses raised by Jackson

National were hotly contested, with Jackson Nat ional disputing near ly every aspect of Plaintiffs

affirmative case.

13. The Corley Law Firm has prosecuted this litigation solely on a contingent-fee basis ,

and we have been at risk that we would not receive any compensation for prosecuting claims
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against Jackson National. While Corley Law Finn devoted its time and its resources to this matter ,

it has foregone other legal work for which it would have been compensated.

14. The hourly rates for the attorneys in my finn included in Paragraph 9 are the usual

and customary hourly rates currently charged by Corley Law Finn in commercial litigation matters

with monthly billing against a retaine r. However, given the nature of the work performed in this

matter , the market rates for legal work of this nature, the complexity of the legal issues, and given

the uncertainty of a payment to the Corley Law Finn relative to retainer billing, it is my opinion

that a reasonable hourly rate for services performed by the undersigned in this matter should be

$650.00. This adjustment for rate yields the following:

Timekeeper

Gary D. Corley

Jared T. Elk

Total

Hours

1322.9

207.6

Rate

$650.00

$250.00

Dollars

$859,885.00

$ 51,900.00

$911,785.00

EXPENSES

15. Corley Law Finn has expended a total of $1,225.06 in unreimbursed costs and

expenses in connect ion with the prosecution of this litigation that were not expenses shared with

the other co-counsel firm. These costs and expenses are the travel charges in conjunction with

travel for counse l and associates ofCorley Law Firm to the oral argument in New Orleans between

April 29 and April 30, 2019. The charges were incurred on behalf of the Class by Corley Law

Finn on a contingent basis , have not been reimbursed, and are actual costs with no administrative

overhead applied. The expenses incurred in this action are reflected on the books and records of

Corley Law Finn. These books and records are prepared from expense vouchers, check records ,

and other source materials and they represent an accurate recordation of the expenses incurred.
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16. I have reviewed the time and expenses reported by my firm in this case which are

included in this declaration, and I affirm that they are true and accurate.

I declare under penalty of perjury pursuant to 41 U.S.c. § 1746 that the foregoing is true

and correct.

Executed on April 27, 2021 in Sherman , Texas .
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EXHIBIT "1"
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Corley Law Firm

108 North Travis Street
Sherman. Texas 75090

Main: 903-892-1048
Fax: 214-260-4925

garyco rlev@gcorleylaw.com

GARY D. CORLEY, P.c.
FederallD. #32-0138785

FOR PROFESSIO NAL LEGAL SERVICES RENDERED

Re: Tredinnick v. et al v. Jackson National Life Insurance Company
Billing for Timekeeper: GDC

Date Description Hours

04/14/16 Prepare James Glenn's complaint letter- copies to JNL and FINRA. 8.0
Receipt and review talking points with Tony Dowling re: JNL's
termination of Hightower's Power of Appointment on the basis that JNL
is uncomfortable with Hightower 's investment strategies. There have
been 2138 transactions that have been vetted by Compliance and
subsequent Audit by FINRA. Receipt and review JNL's Alert/Warning
letter when an annuitant makes an excess withdrawal above its GAWA.
Meeting with Tim and Rory in Mount Pleasant. Telephone call to Sam
Baxter about a potential class action case.

04/15/16 Legal research on prior JNL litigation. Rescission was proper based upon 8.0
fraudulent misrepresentation of Broker in submission of Application a
case holding that the Broker's claims are independent of customers'
claims. Receipt and review of Hightower Appointment by JNL. Receipt
and review spreadsheet showing transfers of Prudential annuiti es to JNL:
owners , dates, amounts.

04/18/16 Conduct legal research on Securities Act, Class Certification, variable 8.0
annuity contracts, regulation of variable annuity products, SEC and
FINRA regulations, and financial advisor and fiduciary roles. Receipt and
review JNL's letter dated August 14, 2015 addressed to Hightower in
which JNL, after a review of his book of business defines what JNL
considers to be "re-entry." Review Hightower investment strategy. Phone
calls with Tim. Review correspondence from JNL informing Hightower
"Please be advised , the exception that was granted for you in 2011 to issue
multiple contracts for a single client is no longer in effect. From this point
forward , you will need to follow standard Jackson procedures when
issuing contracts. "

04/19/16 Receipt and review JNL letter to Allen and Linda Pierce dated April 5, 6.5
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2016 concerning a notice of replacement. Discussions with Hightower of
the letter, replacement mechanics in the policy, the industry term and
meaning of "persistence." Phone calls with Rory and Laura. Recei ve and
review the JNL termination letter to Hightower. Research on Ron King
and Anthony Dowling. Prepare letter to JNL on behalf of the Tredinnicks
regarding the recent Termination of Hightower 's Appointment. Continue
legal research.

04/21/16 Receipt and review CIG and JNL's Amendment to Selling Agreement. 4.5

04/22/16 Fax to Tony Dowling requesting to speak with him re: my April 19th 0.3
correspondence to him.

04/28/16 Receipt and review JNL's reply to my correspondence ofApril 19th. Kerri 7.8
Page, a Customer Relations Representative, makes the Reply. In it, she
states: "We respectfully disagree with your claim that Jackson has in some
way breached its fiduciary duties to Mr. and Ms. Tredinnick." Prepare a
letter to Kerri Page. In it, I offered to get Mr. Hightower on a conference
call , allow him to waive any confidentiality concern regarding his and
JNL's relationship, and then discuss all the issues. Emailed draft to Rory
for his input. Rory made some modifications and returned them to me .
Modifications were incorporated.

04/29/16 Further discussion with Rory concerning the letter to JNL on behalf 2.5
of the Tredinnicks. Further modifications to the letter resulted.

05/02116 Letter to Kerri Page faxed to her on 511 . Recei ved call from Rory to 5.2
discuss GWB Step-up letter addressed to Dorothy Thomas. GWB is
Guaranteed Withdrawal Balance. GWB is the charge base, or the amount
against which JNL charges against Dorothy's annuity. Receipt and review
Rory 's Memorandum on the manner in which JNL's GWB Step-up costs
Dorothy Thomas and does not increase her GAWA, Guaranteed Annual
Withdrawal Amount. GAWA is the income rider. JNL implies in its lette r
that her income has increased, which it hasn't.

05/03/16 Receipt and review Rory 's letter prepared for Dorothy Thomas to JNL. 0.7
I made a few changes and returned it to Rory for signature of Dorothy
Thomas and mailing to JNL.

05/06/16 Telephone calls between Tim and I regarding the Texas Department of 5.4
Insurance and Tim concerning JNL's conduct. Review of the letter Rory
prepared to send to Philip Reyna at TD!. Commented on it.

05/10/16 Receipt and review JNL's response to Dorothy Thomas mquiry. 0.8
Telephone call to Rory for discussion of same.

05/09116 Receipt and review FINRA's reply to Jeffrey and Karen Miller 's 0.4
complaint of JNL.

05112/16 Receipt and review JNL's response to the my most recent correspondence 0.5
on behalf of the Tredinnicks. Telephone call to Tim Hightower

OS/24/16 Receipt and review correspondence of JNL to Hightower informing him 4.2
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that since he is not a Producer with active status he can't request contract
owner correspondence. Asked Rory what information had been requested
to generate the JNL letter. Rory said that they had requested the current
death benefit on Patricia Tribble 's account. This is contrary to JNL's
Termination of Appointment letter to Hightower dated March 14, 2016
wherein JNL stated : "You will, however, continue to be able to service
any contracts that were held under your producer numbers." On April 28,
2016, in separate letters addressed to the Millers and the Tredinnicks, JNL
stated: "We can confirm that although Mr. Hightower may continue to
service your Jackson contracts...."

06/16/16 Travel to Mt. Pleasant for meeting with Tim and Rory. 8.0

06/28/16 Initiate a letter on behalf of the Millers to FINRA re: JNL conduct and 2.6
complaining against JNL.

06/29/16 Further work on the Millers ' letter to FINRA. Copy sent to Rory. 3.2
Telephone call from Rory re: the letter.

07/01/16 Finalize the FINRA letter on behalf of the Millers. Sent the letter to Rory 1.7
to have him go over it with the Millers prior to sending to FINRA.

07/05/16 Millers made two minor changes to the letter and approved it as modified. 0.3
The letter was sent to FINRA

07/06/16 Communications between myself and Laura regarding FINRA and the 0.5
letter that was sent on behalf of the Millers .

07/20/16 Prepare letter to David Williams of Williams Financial Group (WFG) 3.5
informing WFG of its breach of fiduciary duty to my clients and telling
David that WFG can be a part of the problem or a part of the solution and
requested he give me a call. Receipt and review Re-Entry Transactions
from Rory (Spread sheet).

07/24/16 Legal research on the Securities Act and associated cases and litigation. 8.5

07/25/16 Prepared a letter and sent to Laura to have Clients review. Draft letter to 4.8
JNL on behalf of Sears. Prepared letter to TDI on behalf of Sears.

08/16/16 Initiate drafting of a Complaint. 7.0

08/17/16 Further drafting of the Complaint. 7.0

08/18/16 Finalize the Complaint and send it to Rory and Tim. 4.5

08/25/16 Receipt and review from Rory the new DOL Fiduciary Rule Documents. 2.0
The link to the rule: https://www.dol.gov/agencies/ebsa/laws-and-
regulations/rules-and-regulations/completed-rulemaking/1210-AB32-2

08/26/16 Travel to Mt. Pleasant to meet and discuss with Tim and Rory the 9.0
Hightower Strategy - Multiple Contracts Strategy.

09/05/16 Telephone call to Sam Baxter regarding the Class Action case I spoke 0.4
with him about previously. Sam led me to call Lew LeClair. Telephoned
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10/10/16 Made some suggestions to Lew's draft Complaint and sent them to him. 1.3

10/11/16 Email from Lew re the suggested changes and attaching a couple of 0.8
Articles on Choice of Law and Multi State Litigation. Discuss with Lew
an upcoming conference on class action lawsuits and recent developments
in class action practice.

10/12/16 Email Lew to discuss the JNL letter it uniformly sends out to contract 0.7
owners who make a partial excess withdrawal and provides financial
advice in so doing . Providing financial advice triggers a fiduciary role.

10/13/16 Receipt and review Rory 's Memo on JNL's letter to contract owners who 0.6
make partial excess withdrawals. Email to Lew with comments.

10/25/16 Receipt and review Lew's email following his attendance on the class 0.5
action conference and discuss recent developments.

10/28/16 Conference call with Tim, Rory and Lew to discuss the pleading in the 0.8
draft Complaint.

11/02/16 SOS research and legal research on the various Jackson entities. Emailed 5.3
same to Lew.

11/07/16 Prepare for and hold telephone conference with Lew. Conduct some 3.0
research on the venue issue.

11/08/16 Obtain Hightower 's JNL products, clients, and contract dates from Rory. 0.7
Send them to Lew.

11/22/16 Email from Lew regarding the surrender dates for each of the Class 2.6
Representative. Email to Rory to obtain same and forward to Lew.
Request to Tim Hightower to Index and chronologically Organize
telephone log between HF and JNL regarding "grossing up" and/or "net
withdrawal". Also to include a description of the subject matter and
identity of the JNL employee.

11/23/16 Telephone conference with Tim, Rory and Lew to discuss Premium Credit 4.7
Recapture Charge. Receipt and review latest version of the Complaint.

11/25/16 Telephone call to Lew. 0.2

11/28/16 Telephone conference with Tim, Rory and Lew. Legal research on 3.5
Jackson's Edgar filings

11/29/16 Receipt and review of surrender charges for each JNL annuitant. 6.7

11/30/16 Complaint is filed. Email to Lew regarding need to research industry 0.5
standard.

12/01/16 Further discussions with Lew about industry standard. 1.3

12/07/16 Further talks regard ing signing up clients with same type claims against 0.8
other Life Insurance Companies.
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